
Exhibit A  

(Ord. 2023-09-05)

City of Quinlan Local Code Amendments: 

2018 IBC International Building Code (ICC) ……………............. Section A-1 

2018 IRC International Residential Code (ICC) ……………............. Section A-2 

2017 NEC National Electrical Code (NFPA) ……………............. Section A-3 

2018 IFGC International Fuel Gas Code (ICC) ……………............. Section A-4 

2018 IMC International Mechanical Code (ICC)  …………………… Section A-5 

2018 IPC International Plumbing Code (ICC) ……………............. Section A-6 

2018 IPMC International Property Maintenance Code (ICC) ………… Section A-7 

2018 IFC International Fire Code (ICC)   …………………………... Section A-8 

2018 IECC International Energy Conservation Code (ICC) …............. Section A-9 

2018 IEBC International Existing Building Code (ICC) ……………... Section A-10 

2018 ISPSC International Swimming Pool and Spa Code (ICC)  ..……. Section A-11 



 

North Central Texas Council of Governments           1 Approved September 2018 
Amendments / (+City Amendment Sept. 2023)  2018 International Building Code  

Recommended Amendments to the 
2018 International Building Code 

North Central Texas Council of Governments Region 
 
The following sections, paragraphs, and sentences of the 2018 International Building Code are hereby 
amended as follows: Standard type is text from the IBC. Underlined type is text inserted. Lined through 
type is deleted text from IBC. A double asterisk (**) at the beginning of a section identifies an amendment 
carried over from the 2015 edition of the code and a triple asterisk (***) identifies a new or revised 
amendment with the 2018 code. 
  

 
Explanation of Options A and B: 
Please note that as there is a wide range in fire fighting philosophies / capabilities of cities across the 
region, OPTION “A” and OPTION “B” are provided in the Fire and Building Code amendments.  
Jurisdictions should choose one or the other based on their fire fighting philosophies / capabilities 
when adopting code amendments. 
  

 
 
**Section 101.4; change to read as follows: 
 
101.4 Referenced codes.  The other codes listed in Sections 101.4.1 through 101.4.8 and referenced 
elsewhere in this code, when specifically adopted, shall be considered part of the requirements of this 
code to the prescribed extent of each such reference.  Whenever amendments have been adopted to the 
referenced codes and standards, each reference to said code and standard shall be considered to 
reference the amendments as well.  Any reference to NFPA 70 or the Electrical Code shall mean the 
Electrical Code as adopted. 
 
(Reason:  Legal wording to recognize locally adopted codes and amendments adopted with referenced 
codes. The former ICC Electrical Code is now Appendix K of this code but no longer called by that name.) 

 
**Section 101.4.8; add the following: 
 
101.4.8 Electrical. The provisions of the Electrical Code shall apply to the installation of electrical 
systems, including alterations, repairs, replacement, equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and 
appurtenances thereto. 
 
(Reason: This was dropped when ICC quit publishing the ICC Electrical Code, but the Electrical Code still 
should be referenced regardless of how it is adopted.) 
  
** Section 103 and 103.1; amend to insert the Department Name 
 

Code Compliance 
 
103.1 Creation of enforcement agency. The Department of Building Safety City of Quinlan Building 
Department is hereby created and the official in charge thereof shall be known as the building official. 
 
(Reason: Reminder to be sure ordinance reads the same as designated by the city.) 
 
***Section [A] 104.2.1 Determination of substantially improved or substantially damaged existing 
buildings and structures in flood hazard areas. (Jurisdictions may consider the option to amend or 
delete depending on local enforcement and flood hazard ordinances.) 
 
(Reason: Flood hazard ordinances may be administered by other departments within the city.) 

Exhibit A, Section A‐1 
2018 IBC Local Amendments 

(Option A Selected) 
Adopted 9‐11‐23 



 

North Central Texas Council of Governments           2 Approved September 2018 
Amendments / (+City Amendment Sept. 2023)  2018 International Building Code  

**Section 104.10.1; Flood hazard areas.   (Jurisdictions may consider the option to amend or delete 
depending on local enforcement and flood hazard ordinances.) 
 
(Reason: Flood hazard ordinances may be administered by other departments within the city.) 
 
**Section 105.2 Work exempt from permit; under sub-title entitled “Building” delete items 1, 2, 10 
and 11 and re-number as follows: 
 
Building: 

1. One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses and similar 
uses, provided the floor area does not exceed 120 square feet (11 m2).  

2. Fences not over 7 feet (1829 mm) high.  

3. 1. (Remainder Unchanged) 

4. 2. (Remainder Unchanged) 

5. 3. (Remainder Unchanged) 

6. 4. (Remainder Unchanged) 

7. 5. (Remainder Unchanged)  

8. 6. ( Remainder Unchanged) 

9. 7. (Remainder Unchanged) 

10. Shade cloth structures constructed for nursery or agricultural purposes, not including service 
systems.  

11. 8. (Remainder Unchanged)  

12. 9.  (Remainder Unchanged) 
13. 10. (Remainder Unchanged) 

 
(Reason: Items deleted are for one- and two-family dwellings regulated by the International Residential 
Code. Accessory structures, fences and shade cloth structures would require a permit for commercial 
properties to ensure compliance with local ordinance, egress, accessibility, flame spread of fabric, 
wind/snow design load, etc.) 
 
**Section 109; add Section 109.7 to read as follows: 
 
109.7 Re-inspection Fee. A fee as established by city council resolution may be charged when: 
 

1. The inspection called for is not ready when the inspector arrives; 
 
2. No building address or permit card is clearly posted; 
 
3. City approved plans are not on the job site available to the inspector; 
 
4. The building is locked or work otherwise not available for inspection when called; 
 
5. The job site is red-tagged twice for the same item; 
 
6. The original red tag has been removed from the job site. 
 
7. Failure to maintain erosion control, trash control or tree protection. 

 



 

North Central Texas Council of Governments           3 Approved September 2018 
Amendments / (+City Amendment Sept. 2023)  2018 International Building Code  

  Any re-inspection fees assessed shall be paid before any more inspections are made on that job site. 
 
(Reason: This fee is not a fine or penalty but is designed to compensate for time and trips when 
inspections are called for when not ready.)   
 
**Section 109; add Section 109.8, 109.8.1, 109.8.2 and 109.9 to read as follows: 
 
109.8 Work without a permit. 
 

109.8.1 Investigation. Whenever work for which a permit is required by this code has been 
commenced without first obtaining a permit, a special investigation shall be made before a permit 
may be issued for such work. 

 
109.8.2 Fee. An investigation fee, in addition to the permit fee, shall be collected whether or not a 
permit is subsequently issued. The investigation fee shall be equal to the amount of the permit fee 
required by this code or the city fee schedule as applicable. The payment of such investigation fee 
shall not exempt the applicant from compliance with all other provisions of either this code or the 
technical codes nor from penalty prescribed by law. 

 
109.9 Unauthorized cover up fee. Any work concealed without first obtaining the required inspection in 
violation of Section 110 shall be assessed a fee as established by the city fee schedule.  
 
(Reason: This fee is not a fine or penalty but is designed to compensate for time and to remove incentive 
to attempt to evade permits and code compliance. Text taken from former Uniform Administrative Code.) 
 
***Section 110.3.5; Lath, gypsum board and gypsum panel product inspection; Delete exception 
 
Exception : Gypsum board and gypsum panel products that are not part of a fire resistance rated 
assembly or a shear assembly. 
 
(Reason: Lath or gypsum board inspections are not typically performed in this area.) 
 
***Section 202; amend definition of Ambulatory Care Facility as follows:  
 
AMBULATORY CARE FACILITY. Buildings or portions thereof used to provide medical, surgical, 
psychiatric, nursing or similar care on a less than 24-hour basis to individuals who are rendered incapable 
of self-preservation by the services provided or staff has accepted responsibility for care recipients 
already incapable. This group may include but not be limited to the following: 

- Dialysis centers 
- Sedation dentistry 
- Surgery centers 
- Colonic centers 
- Psychiatric centers 

 
(Reason: To clarify the range of uses included in the definition. [Explanatory note related to Ambulatory 
Care Facilities: This group of uses includes medical or dental offices where persons are put under for 
dental surgery or other services. Section 903.2.2 will now require such uses to be sprinklered if on other 
than the floor of exit discharge or if four or more persons are put under on the level of exit discharge. 
Recommend (1.) jurisdictions document any pre-existing non-conforming conditions prior to issuing a new 
C of O for a change of tenant and, (2.) On any medical or dental office specify on C of O the maximum 
number of persons permitted to be put under general anesthesia. It is recommended that before a 
Certificate of Occupancy is issued, a letter of intended use from the business owner shall be included and 
a C of O documenting the maximum number of care recipients incapable of self preservation allowed.) 
 
**Section 202; add definition of Assisting Living Facilities to read as follows. 



 

North Central Texas Council of Governments           4 Approved September 2018 
Amendments / (+City Amendment Sept. 2023)  2018 International Building Code  

 
ASSISTED LIVING FACILITIES.  A building or part thereof housing persons, on a 24-hour basis, who 
because of age, mental disability or other reasons, live in a supervised residential environment which 
provides personal care services. The occupants are capable of responding to an emergency situation 
without physical assistance from staff. 
 
(Reason: The code references Assisted Living facilities and definition was deleted.)  
 
**Section 202; change definition of “Atrium” as follows: 
 
ATRIUM.  An opening connecting two three or more stories… {Balance remains unchanged} 
 
(Reason: Accepted practice in the region based on legacy codes. Section 1019 permits unenclosed two 
story stairways under certain circumstances.) 
 
***Section 202; add amend definition of “Repair Garage” as follows: 
 
REPAIR GARAGE. A building, structure or portion thereof used for servicing or repairing motor vehicles. 
This occupancy shall also include garages involved in minor repair, modification and servicing of motor 
vehicles for items such as lube changes, inspections, windshield repair or replacement, shocks, minor 
part replacement and other such minor repairs.   
 
(Reason: The code references aligns with fire code.)  
 
**Section 202; amend definition of SPECIAL INSPECTOR to read as follows: 
 
SPECIAL INSPECTOR. A qualified person employed or retained by an approved agency who shall prove 
to the satisfaction of the registered design professional in responsible charge and approved by the 
Building Official as having the competence necessary to inspect a particular type of construction requiring 
special inspection.  
 
(Reason: The registered design professional in responsible charge should be included.)  
 

Option A 
**Section 202; {No amendment necessary} 
  

 

Option B  
**Section 202; amend definition to read as follows: 
 
HIGH-RISE BUILDING.  A building with an occupied floor located more than 75 55 feet (22 860 mm) 
(16 764 mm) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access. 
  

 
(Reason: To define high-rise, as it influences sprinkler requirement thresholds based on the fire fighting 
capabilities of a jurisdiction.) 
 
***Section 303.1.3; add a sentence to read as follows: 
 
303.1.3 Associated with Group E occupancies.  A room or space used for assembly purposes that is 
associated with a Group E occupancy is not considered a separate occupancy, Except when applying the 
assembly requirements of Chapters 10 and 11. 
 



 

North Central Texas Council of Governments           5 Approved September 2018 
Amendments / (+City Amendment Sept. 2023)  2018 International Building Code  

(Reason: To clarify that egress and accessibility requirements are applicable for assembly areas, i.e. 
cafeteria, auditoriums, etc.) 
 
**Section 304.1; add the following to the list of occupancies: 
 

Fire stations  
Police stations with detention facilities for 5 or less  

 
(Reason: Consistent with regional practice dating back to the legacy codes.) 
 
**Section 307.1.1; add the following sentence to Exception 4: 
 
4. Cleaning establishments… {Text unchanged} …with Section 707 or 1-hour horizontal assemblies 
constructed in accordance with Section 711 or both. See also IFC Chapter 21, Dry Cleaning Plant 
provisions. 
 
 (Reason: To call attention to detailed requirements in the Fire Code.) 
 
**Section 403.1, Exception 3; change to read as follows: 
 

3. The open air portion of a building [remainder unchanged]  
 
(Reason: To clarify enclosed portions are not exempt.)  
 
**Section 403.3, Exception; delete item 2. 
 
(Reason: To provide adequate fire protection to enclosed areas.)  
 
**Section 403.3.2; change to read as follows: 
 

[F] 403.3.2 Water supply to required fire pumps. In buildings that are more than 420 120 feet (36.5 m) 
in building height, required fire pumps shall be supplied by connections to no fewer than two water mains 
located in different streets. Separate supply piping shall be provided between each connection to the 
water main and the pumps. Each connection and the supply piping between the connection and the 
pumps shall be sized to supply the flow and pressure required for the pumps to operate. 

 

Exception: {No change to exception.} 
 

(Reason:  The 2009 edition of the IFC added this requirement based on a need for redundancy of the 
water supply similar to the redundancy of the power supply to the fire pumps required for such tall 
buildings, partially due to the fact that these buildings are rarely fully evacuated in a fire event.  More 
commonly, the alarm activates on the floor of the event, the floor above and the floor below.  Back-up 
power to the fire pump becomes critical for this reason.  Certainly, the power is pointless if the water 
supply is impaired for any reason, so a similar requirement is provided here for redundant water supplies.  
The 2015 edition changed the requirement to only apply to very tall buildings over 420 ft.  This 
amendment modifies/lowers the requirement to 120 ft., based on this same height requirement for fire 
service access elevators.  Again, the language from the 2009 and 2012 editions of the code applied to 
any high-rise building. This compromise at 120 ft. is based on the above technical justification of defend-
in-place scenarios in fire incidents in such tall structures.) 
 
**Section 404.5; delete Exception. 
 
(Reason: Consistent with amended atrium definition.) 
 
**Section 406.3.3.1 Carport separation; add sentence to read as follows: 



 

North Central Texas Council of Governments           6 Approved September 2018 
Amendments / (+City Amendment Sept. 2023)  2018 International Building Code  

 
A fire separation is not required between a Group R-2 and U carport provided that the carport is 

entirely open on all sides and that the distance between the two is at least 10 feet (3048 mm). 
 

(Reason: Simplifies the fire separation distance and eliminates the need to obtain opening information on 
existing buildings when adding carports in existing apartment complexes. Consistent with legacy codes in 
effect in region for years and no record of problems with car fires spreading to apartments as a result.) 
 
***Section 423.3; add exception to read as follows: 

423.3 Critical emergency operations. [Existing Text remains]  

Exception:  Fire stations with volunteer fire services on an as-needed basis shall not be classified as 
“critical emergency operations.” These facilities shall meet the typical code requirements identified in 
2018 IBC providing wind design loads for the local area, ASCE 7-16, category (4) @ 115 mph. 

 (Local Amendment: To differentiate a volunteer facility not perpetually manned with 24-hour operations, 
and the workers are not operating the facility full time.) 
 
***Table 506.2; delete sentence from table 

I. The maximum allowable area for a single-story non sprinklered Group U greenhouse is permitted to be 
9000 square feet or the allowable area shall be permitted to comply with Table C102.1 of Appendix C. 

(Reason: To eliminate the need for Appendix C adoption and remain consistent with 6000 sq. ft. 
sprinklering provision.) 
 
**Section 506.3.1; add sentence to read as follows: 

506.3.1 Minimum percentage of perimeter. [Existing Text remains]  

In order to be considered as accessible, if not in direct contact with a street or fire lane, a minimum 10-
foot wide pathway meeting fire department access from the street or approved fire lane shall be provided. 

(Reason: To define what is considered accessible.  Consistent with regional amendment to IFC 504.1.) 
 
***Section 602.1.1; add sentence to read as follows: 

602.1.1 Minimum Requirements.  [Existing Text to remain]  

Where a building contains more than one distinct type of construction, the building shall comply with the 
most restrictive area, height, and stories, for the lesser type of construction or be separated by fire walls. 

 (Reason: To create definite language that requires separation between dissimilar building types.) 
 
***Section 708.4.2; change sentence to read as follows: 
 
708.4.2 Fireblocks and draftstops in combustible construction. [Body of text unchanged] 

 
Exceptions:  



 

North Central Texas Council of Governments           7 Approved September 2018 
Amendments / (+City Amendment Sept. 2023)  2018 International Building Code  

1. Buildings equipped with an automatic sprinkler system installed throughout in accordance 
with Section 903.3.1.1, or in accordance with Section 903.3.1.2 provided that sprinkler 
protection is provided in the space between the top of the fire partition and the underside of 
the floor or roof sheathing, deck or slab above as required for systems complying with 
Section 903.3.1.1. Portions of buildings containing concealed spaces filled with 
noncombustible insulation as permitted for sprinkler omission shall not apply to this exception 
for draftstopping.          [Remainder unchanged] 

Reason: (The most common exception used to eliminate the need for sprinklers in concealed spaces of 
combustible construction is to fill the space with noncombustible insulation. This exception was changed 
in 2010 to permit a 2-inch air gap at the top of the filled space. A space compliant with the permitted 
omission above would allow hot gas and smoke to spread unimpeded throughout a building not provided 
with draftstopping. For this reason, omission of sprinklers permitted in accordance with NFPA 13 
referenced standard should not be permitted with IBC exception requiring draftstopping in combustible 
construction.) 
 
***Section 718.3; change sentence to read as follows: 
 
718.3 Draftstopping in floors. [Body of text unchanged] 

 
Exceptions: Buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in accordance 
with Section 903.3.1.1. and provided that in combustible construction, sprinkler protection is 
provided in the floor space. 
 

(Reason: To remain consistent with changes in 708.4.2 code.) 
 
***Section 718.4; change sentence to read as follows: 
 
718.4 Draftstopping in attics. [Body of text unchanged] 
 

Exceptions: Buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in accordance 
with Section 903.3.1.1 and provided that in combustible construction, sprinkler protection is 
provided in the attic space. 
 

(Reason: To remain consistent with changes in 708.4.2 code.) 
 
**Section 901.6.1; add Section 901.6.1.1 to read as follows: 
 
901.6.1.1 Standpipe Testing.  Building owners/managers must maintain and test standpipe systems as 
per NFPA 25 requirements. The following additional requirements shall be applied to the testing that is 
required every 5 years:   

 
1. The piping between the Fire Department Connection (FDC) and the standpipe shall be backflushed 

or inspected by approved camera when foreign material is present or when caps are missing, and 
also hydrostatically tested for all FDC’s on any type of standpipe system. Hydrostatic testing shall 
also be conducted in accordance with NFPA 25 requirements for the different types of standpipe 
systems. 
 

2. For any manual (dry or wet) standpipe system not having an automatic water supply capable of 
flowing water through the standpipe, the tester shall connect hose from a fire hydrant or portable 
pumping system (as approved by the fire code official) to each FDC, and flow water through the 
standpipe system to the roof outlet to verify that each inlet connection functions properly. Confirm 
that there are no open hose valves prior to introducing water into a dry standpipe. There is no 



 

North Central Texas Council of Governments           8 Approved September 2018 
Amendments / (+City Amendment Sept. 2023)  2018 International Building Code  

required pressure criteria at the outlet.  Verify that check valves function properly and that there are 
no closed control valves on the system. 
 

3. Any pressure relief, reducing, or control valves shall be tested in accordance with the requirements 
of NFPA 25. All hose valves shall be exercised. 
 

4. If the FDC is not already provided with approved caps, the contractor shall install such caps for all 
FDC’s as required by the fire code official. 
 

5. Upon successful completion of standpipe test, place a blue tag (as per Texas Administrative Code, 
Fire Sprinkler Rules for Inspection, Test and Maintenance Service (ITM) Tag) at the bottom of 
each standpipe riser in the building.  The tag shall be check-marked as “Fifth Year” for Type of ITM, 
and the note on the back of the tag shall read “5 Year Standpipe Test” at a minimum. 
 

6. The procedures required by Texas Administrative Code Fire Sprinkler Rules with regard to Yellow 
Tags and Red Tags or any deficiencies noted during the testing, including the required 
notification of the local Authority Having Jurisdiction (fire code official) shall be followed.   
 

7. Additionally, records of the testing shall be maintained by the owner and contractor, if applicable, 
as required by the State Rules mentioned above and NFPA 25. 

 
8. Standpipe system tests where water will be flowed external to the building shall not be conducted 

during freezing conditions or during the day prior to expected night time freezing conditions.   
 

9. Contact the fire code official for requests to remove existing fire hose from Class II and III standpipe 
systems where employees are not trained in the utilization of this firefighting equipment.  All 
standpipe hose valves must remain in place and be provided with an approved cap and chain when 
approval is given to remove hose by the fire code official. 

 
(Reason: Increases the reliability of the fire protection system and re-emphasizes the requirements of 
NFPA 25 relative to standpipe systems, as well as ensuring that FDC connections are similarly 
tested/maintained to ensure operation in an emergency incident.) 

 
**Section 903.1.1; change to read as follows: 
 
903.1.1 Alternative Protection. Alternative automatic fire-extinguishing systems complying with Section 
904 shall be permitted instead of in addition to automatic sprinkler protection where recognized by the 
applicable standard and, or as approved by the fire code official. 
 
(Reason: Such alternative systems do not provide the reliability of automatic sprinkler protection.  Most 
gaseous type systems are highly susceptible to open doors, ceiling or floor tile removal, etc.  However, an 
applicant could pursue an Alternate Method request to help mitigate the reliability issues with these 
alternative systems with the fire code official if so desired, or there may be circumstances in which the fire 
code official is acceptable to allowing an alternate system in lieu of sprinklers, such as kitchen hoods or 
paint booths.) 

 
**Section 903.2; add paragraph to read as follows and delete the exception: 
 
Automatic Sprinklers shall not be installed in elevator machine rooms, elevator machine spaces, and 
elevator hoistways, other than pits where such sprinklers would not necessitate shunt trip requirements 
under any circumstances. Storage shall not be allowed within the elevator machine room. Signage shall 
be provided at the entry doors to the elevator machine room indicating “ELEVATOR MACHINERY – NO 
STORAGE ALLOWED.”  



 

North Central Texas Council of Governments           9 Approved September 2018 
Amendments / (+City Amendment Sept. 2023)  2018 International Building Code  

 
(Reason:  Firefighter and public safety. This amendment eliminates the shunt trip requirement of the 
International Building Code Section 3005.5 for the purpose of elevator passenger and firefighter safety. 
This amendment is contingent on the Building Code amendment eliminating the Exceptions to Section 
3005.4, such that passive fire barriers for these areas are maintained.  The exception deletion is due to 
the fact that such telecom areas pose an undue fire risk to the structural integrity of the building.) 

 
**Section 903.2.9; add Section 903.2.9.3 to read as follows: 
 
903.2.9.3 Self-Service Storage Facility.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout all 
self-service storage facilities. 
(Reason: Fire departments are unable to inspect these commercial occupancies and are unaware of the 
contents being stored. Previous allowance to separate units by fire barriers is difficult to enforce 
maintenance after opening.) 

 

**Option A 
Section 903.2.11; change 903.2.11.3 and add 903.2.11.7 and 903.2.11.8, as follows: 
 
903.2.11.3 Buildings 55 Feet or more in Height.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed 
throughout buildings that have one or more stories with an occupant load of 30 or more, other than 
penthouses in compliance with Section 1510 of the International Building Code, located 55 feet (16 
764 mm) or more above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access, measured to the finished 
floor. 
 Exceptions: 
 1.  Open parking structures in compliance with Section 406.5 of the International Building 

Code, having no other occupancies above the subject garage. 
 
 2.  Occupancies in Group F-2. 

 
903.2.11.7 High-Piled Combustible Storage.  For any building with a clear height exceeding 12 feet 
(4572 mm), see Chapter 32 to determine if those provisions apply. 
 
903.2.11.8 Spray Booths and Rooms.  New and existing spray booths and spraying rooms shall be 
protected by an approved automatic fire-extinguishing system. 

 

**Option B  
Section 903.2.11; change 903.2.11.3 and add 903.2.11.7, 903.2.11.8, and 903.2.11.9 as follows: 
 
903.2.11.3 Buildings 55 35 feet or more in height.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed 
throughout buildings that have one or more stories with an occupant load of 30 or more, other than 
penthouses in compliance with Section 1510 of the International Building Code, located 55 35 feet 
(16 764 10 668 mm) or more above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access, measured to 
the finished floor. 
 Exceptions: 
 1.  Open parking structures in compliance with Section 406.5 of the International Building 

Code, having no other occupancies above the subject garage. 
 
 2.  Occupancies in Group F-2.   
 
903.2.11.7 High-Piled Combustible Storage.  For any building with a clear height exceeding 12 feet 
(4572 mm), see Chapter 32 to determine if those provisions apply. 
 



 

North Central Texas Council of Governments           10 Approved September 2018 
Amendments / (+City Amendment Sept. 2023)  2018 International Building Code  

903.2.11.8 Spray Booths and Rooms.  New and existing spray booths and spraying rooms shall be 
protected by an approved automatic fire-extinguishing system. 
 
903.2.11.9 Buildings Over 6,000 sq. ft.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout 
all buildings with a building area 6,000 sq. ft. or greater and in all existing buildings that are enlarged 
to be 6,000 sq. ft. or greater.  For the purpose of this provision, fire walls shall not define separate 
buildings.   
 
 Exception: Open parking garages in compliance with Section 406.5 of the International Building 

Code. 

(Reason: Provides jurisdictions options as to their desired level of sprinkler protection based on multiple 
factors including firefighting philosophies/capabilities.) 

 
**Section 903.3.1.1.1; change to read as follows: 
 
 

903.3.1.1.1 Exempt Locations.  When approved by the fire code official, automatic sprinklers shall not 
be required in the following rooms or areas where such ...{text unchanged}… because it is damp, of fire-
resistance-rated construction or contains electrical equipment. 
 

1. Any room where the application of water, or flame and water, constitutes a serious life or fire 
hazard. 

2. Any room or space where sprinklers are considered undesirable because of the nature of the 
contents, when approved by the fire code official. 

3. Generator and transformer rooms, under the direct control of a public utility, separated from the 
remainder of the building by walls and floor/ceiling or roof/ceiling assemblies having a fire-
resistance rating of not less than 2 hours. 

4. In rooms or areas that are of noncombustible construction with wholly noncombustible contents. 
5. Fire service access Elevator machine rooms, and machinery spaces, and hoistways, other than 

pits where such sprinklers would not necessitate shunt trip requirements under any 
circumstances.  

6.  {Delete.} 
 
(Reason: Gives clarification. Exception 4 deleted to provide protection where fire risks are poorly 
addressed.  Amendment 903.2 addresses Exception 5 above relative to the elimination of sprinkler 
protection in these areas to avoid the shunt trip requirement.) 

 
***Section 903.3.1.2.3; delete sections and replace as follows: 
 
[F] Section 903.3.1.2.3 Attached Garages and Attics.  Sprinkler protection is required in attached 
garages, and in the following attic spaces: 
 

1.  [Remainder Unchanged] 
2.  [Remainder Unchanged] 
3.  Attic spaces of buildings that are two or more stories in height above grade plane or above 

the lowest level of fire department vehicle access. 
4. Group R-4, Condition 2 occupancy attics not required by Item 1 or 3 to have sprinklers shall 

comply with one of the following: 
       [Remainder Unchanged] 

 
(Reason: Attic protection is required due to issues with fire exposure via soffit vents, as well as firefighter 
safety. Several jurisdictions indicated experience with un-protected attic fires resulting in displacement of 
all building occupants. NFPA 13 provides for applicable attic sprinkler protection requirements, as well as 



 

North Central Texas Council of Governments           11 Approved September 2018 
Amendments / (+City Amendment Sept. 2023)  2018 International Building Code  

exemptions to such, based on noncombustible construction, etc. Attached garages already require 
sprinklers via NFPA 13R – this amendment just re-emphasizes the requirement.) 

 
**Section 903.3.1.3; change to read as follows: 
 
903.3.1.3 NFPA 13D Sprinkler Systems.  Automatic sprinkler systems installed in one- and two-family 
dwellings; Group R-3; Group R-4, Condition 1; and townhouses shall be permitted to be installed 
throughout in accordance with NFPA 13D or in accordance with state law. 
 
(Reason: To allow the use of the Plumbing section of the International Residential Code (IRC) and 
recognize current state stipulations in this regard.) 

 
**Section 903.3.1.4; add to read as follows: 
 

[F] 903.3.1.4 Freeze protection. Freeze protection systems for automatic fire sprinkler systems shall be 
in accordance with the requirements of the applicable referenced NFPA standard and this section. 

903.3.1.4.1 Attics. Only dry-pipe, preaction, or listed antifreeze automatic fire sprinkler systems 
shall be allowed to protect attic spaces.  

Exception: Wet-pipe fire sprinkler systems shall be allowed to protect non-ventilated attic 
spaces where: 

1. The attic sprinklers are supplied by a separate floor control valve assembly to 
allow ease of draining the attic system without impairing sprinklers throughout the 
rest of the building, and 

2. Adequate heat shall be provided for freeze protection as per the applicable 
referenced NFPA standard, and 

3. The attic space is a part of the building’s thermal, or heat, envelope, such that 
insulation is provided at the roof deck, rather than at the ceiling level. 

903.3.1.4.2 Heat trace/insulation. Heat trace/insulation shall only be allowed where approved by 
the fire code official for small sections of large diameter water-filled pipe. 

 

(Reason: In the last few years, severe winters brought to light several issues with current practices for 
sprinklering attics, not the least of which was wet-pipe sprinklers in ventilated attics provided with space 
heaters, etc. for freeze protection of such piping.  This practice is not acceptable for the protection of 
water-filled piping in a ventilated attic space as it does not provide a reliable means of maintaining the 
minimum 40 degrees required by NFPA, wastes energy, and presents a potential ignition source to the 
attic space.  Listed antifreeze is specifically included because NFPA currently allows such even though 
there is no currently listed antifreeze at the time of development of these amendments.  The intent of this 
amendment is to help reduce the large number of freeze breaks that have occurred in the past with water-
filled wet-pipe sprinkler systems in the future, most specifically in attic spaces.) 

 
**Section 903.3.5; add a second paragraph to read as follows: 
 
 

Water supply as required for such systems shall be provided in conformance with the supply 
requirements of the respective standards; however, every water-based fire protection system shall be 
designed with a 10 psi safety factor.  Reference Section 507.4 for additional design requirements. 
 
(Reason: To define uniform safety factor for the region.) 

 
**Section 903.4; add a second paragraph after the exceptions to read as follows: 
 
Sprinkler and standpipe system water-flow detectors shall be provided for each floor tap to the sprinkler 
system and shall cause an alarm upon detection of water flow for more than 45 seconds.  All control 



 

North Central Texas Council of Governments           12 Approved September 2018 
Amendments / (+City Amendment Sept. 2023)  2018 International Building Code  

valves in the sprinkler and standpipe systems except for fire department hose connection valves shall be 
electrically supervised to initiate a supervisory signal at the central station upon tampering. 
 
(Reason: To avoid significant water losses.  Consistent with amendment to IFC 905.9.) 

 
**Section 903.4.2; add second paragraph to read as follows: 
 
The alarm device required on the exterior of the building shall be a weatherproof horn/strobe notification 
appliance with a minimum 75 candela strobe rating, installed as close as practicable to the fire 
department connection.   
 
(Reason: Fire department connections are not always located at the riser; this allows the fire department 
faster access.) 

 
**Section 905.2; change to read as follows: 
 
905.2 Installation Standard. Standpipe systems shall be installed in accordance with this section and 
NFPA 14.  Manual dry standpipe systems shall be supervised with a minimum of 10 psig and a maximum 
of 40 psig air pressure with a high/low alarm. 
 
(Reason: To define manual dry standpipe supervision requirements. Helps ensure the integrity of the 
standpipe system via supervision, such that open hose valves will result in a supervisory low air alarm.) 

 
***Section 905.3; add Section 905.3.9 and exception to read as follows: 
 
905.3.9 Buildings Exceeding 10,000 sq. ft. In buildings exceeding 10,000 square feet in area per story 
and where any portion of the building’s interior area is more than 200 feet (60960 mm) of travel, vertically 
and horizontally, from the nearest point of fire department vehicle access, Class I automatic wet or 
manual wet standpipes shall be provided. 
 

Exceptions:  
1. Automatic dry, semi-automatic dry, and manual dry standpipes are allowed as provided for in 

NFPA 14 where approved by the fire code official. 
2. R-2 occupancies of four stories or less in height having no interior corridors. 

 
(Reason: Allows for the rapid deployment of hose lines to the body of the fire.  Manual dry option added 
this edition.) 

 
**Section 905.4, change Item 1, 3, and 5, and add Item 7 to read as follows: 
 

1. In every required interior exit stairway, a hose connection shall be provided for each story above 
and below grade plane.  Hose connections shall be located at the main floor landing between 
stories, unless otherwise approved by the fire code official. 

2. {No change.} 
3. In every exit passageway, at the entrance from the exit passageway to other areas of a building. 
 
Exception:  Where floor areas adjacent to an exit passageway are reachable from an interior exit 

stairway hose connection by a   {No change to rest.}  
 
4. {No change.} 
5. Where the roof has a slope less than four units vertical in 12 units horizontal (33.3-percent slope), 

each standpipe shall be provided with a two-way a hose connection shall be located to serve the 



 

North Central Texas Council of Governments           13 Approved September 2018 
Amendments / (+City Amendment Sept. 2023)  2018 International Building Code  

roof or at the highest landing of an interior exit stairway with stair access to the roof provided in 
accordance with Section 1011.12.  

6. {No change.} 
7. When required by this Chapter, standpipe connections shall be placed adjacent to all required 

exits to the structure and at two hundred feet (200’) intervals along major corridors thereafter, or as 
otherwise approved by the fire code official.    

 
 

(Reason: Item 1, 3, and 5 amendments to remove ‘interior’ will help to clarify that such connections are 
required for all ‘exit’ stairways, to ensure firefighter capabilities are not diminished in these tall buildings, 
simply because the stair is on the exterior of the building. Item 5 reduces the amount of pressure required 
to facilitate testing, and provides backup protection for fire fighter safety. Item 7 allows for the rapid 
deployment of hose lines to the body of the fire.)  

 
**Section 905.9; add a second paragraph after the exceptions to read as follows: 
 
Sprinkler and standpipe system water-flow detectors shall be provided for each floor tap to the sprinkler 
system and shall cause an alarm upon detection of water flow for more than 45 seconds.  All control 
valves in the sprinkler and standpipe systems except for fire department hose connection valves shall be 
electrically supervised to initiate a supervisory signal at the central station upon tampering. 
 
(Reason: To avoid significant water losses.  Consistent with amendment to IFC 903.4.) 

 
**Section 907.1; add Section 907.1.4 to read as follows: 
 
907.1.4 Design Standards.  Where a new fire alarm system is installed, the devices shall be 
addressable.  Fire alarm systems utilizing more than 20 smoke detectors shall have analog initiating 
devices.  

  
(Reason: Provides for the ability of descriptive identification of alarms, and reduces need for panel 
replacement in the future. Updated wording to match the language of the new requirement at 907.5.2.3. 
Change of terminology allows for reference back to definitions of NFPA 72.)   

 
**Section 907.2.1; change to read as follows: 
 
907.2.1 Group A.  A manual fire alarm system that activates the occupant notification system in 
accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in Group A occupancies where the having an occupant 
load due to the assembly occupancy is of 300 or more persons, or where the Group A occupant load is 
more than 100 persons above or below the lowest level of exit discharge. Group A occupancies not 
separated from one another in accordance with Section 707.3.10 of the International Building Code shall 
be considered as a single occupancy for the purposes of applying this section.  Portions of Group E 
occupancies occupied for assembly purposes shall be provided with a fire alarm system as required for 
the Group E occupancy.  
 
 Exception:  {No change.} 
 
Activation of fire alarm notification appliances shall: 

1. Cause illumination of the means of egress with light of not less than 1 foot-candle (11 lux) at the 
walking surface level, and 

2.  Stop any conflicting or confusing sounds and visual distractions. 
 
(Reason: Increases the requirement to be consistent with Group B requirement. Also addresses issue 
found in Group A occupancies of reduced lighting levels and other A/V equipment that distracts from fire 



 

North Central Texas Council of Governments           14 Approved September 2018 
Amendments / (+City Amendment Sept. 2023)  2018 International Building Code  

alarm notification devices or reduces ability of fire alarm system to notify occupants of the emergency 
condition.)  

 
**Section 907.2.3; change to read as follows: 
 
907.2.3 Group E.  A manual fire alarm system that initiates the occupant notification signal utilizing an 
emergency voice/alarm communication system meeting the requirements of Section 907.5.2.2 and 
installed in accordance with Section 907.6 shall be installed in Group E educational occupancies.  When 
automatic sprinkler systems or smoke detectors are installed, such systems or detectors shall be 
connected to the building fire alarm system.  An approved smoke detection system shall be installed in 
Group E day care occupancies.  Unless separated by a minimum of 100' open space, all buildings, 
whether portable buildings or the main building, will be considered one building for alarm occupant load 
consideration and interconnection of alarm systems. 
 

Exceptions: 
1. {No change.} 

1.1. Residential In-Home day care with not more than 12 children may use interconnected 
single station detectors in all habitable rooms. (For care of more than five children 2 1/2 
or less years of age, see Section 907.2.6.)  {No change to remainder of exceptions.} 

 
(Reason: To distinguish educational from day care occupancy minimum protection requirements.  Further, 
to define threshold at which portable buildings are considered a separate building for the purposes of 
alarm systems.  Exceptions provide consistency with State law concerning such occupancies.) 

 
**Section 907.2.12, Exception 3; change to read as follows: 
 
3. Open air portions of buildings with an occupancy in Group A-5 in accordance with Section 303.1 of 

the International Building Code; however, this exception does not apply to accessory uses including 
but not limited to sky boxes, restaurants, and similarly enclosed areas. 

 
(Reason: To indicate that enclosed areas within open air seating type occupancies are not exempted 
from automatic fire alarm system requirements.) 

 
**Section 907.4.2; add Section 907.4.2.7 to read as follows: 
 
907.4.2.7 Type. Manual alarm initiating devices shall be an approved double action type. 
 
(Reason: Helps to reduce false alarms.) 
 
**Section 907.6.1; add Section 907.6.1.1 to read as follows: 
 
907.6.1.1 Wiring Installation.  All fire alarm systems shall be installed in such a manner that a failure of 
any single initiating device or single open in an initiating circuit conductor will not interfere with the normal 
operation of other such devices. All signaling line circuits (SLC) shall be installed in such a way that a 
single open will not interfere with the operation of any addressable devices (Class A). Outgoing and 
return SLC conductors shall be installed in accordance with NFPA 72 requirements for Class A circuits 
and shall have a minimum of four feet separation horizontal and one foot vertical between supply and 
return circuit conductors.  The initiating device circuit (IDC) from a signaling line circuit interface device 
may be wired Class B, provided the distance from the interface device to the initiating device is ten feet or 
less.   
 
(Reason: To provide uniformity in system specifications and guidance to design engineers. Improves 
reliability of fire alarm devices and systems.) 



 

North Central Texas Council of Governments           15 Approved September 2018 
Amendments / (+City Amendment Sept. 2023)  2018 International Building Code  

 
**Section 907.6.3; delete all four Exceptions. 
 
(Reason: To assist responding personnel in locating the emergency event for all fire alarm systems.) 
 
**Section 907.6.6; add sentence at end of paragraph to read as follows: 
 
 See 907.6.3 for the required information transmitted to the supervising station. 
 
 (Reason: To assist responding personnel in locating the emergency event for all fire alarm systems.) 
 
(Reason: Deleted Previous code amendment Section 909.22, For removal because it is already in the 
code in Sections 909.20.5, 909.20.6, 909.20.6.1, 909.20.6.2, and 909.20.6.3.) 

**Section 910.2; change Exception 2 and 3 to read as follows:  
 

 2.  Only manual smoke and heat removal shall not be required in areas of buildings equipped with 
early suppression fast-response (ESFR) sprinklers. Automatic smoke and heat removal is 
prohibited. 

3. Only manual smoke and heat removal shall not be required in areas of buildings equipped with 
control mode special application sprinklers with a response time index of 50(m*S)1/2 or less that 
are listed to control a fire in stored commodities with 12 or fewer sprinklers.  Automatic smoke 
and heat removal is prohibited. 

 
(Reason: Allows the fire department to control the smoke and heat during and after a fire event, while still 
prohibiting such systems from being automatically activated, which is a potential detriment to the 
particular sprinkler systems indicated.) 

 
**Section 910.2; add subsections 910.2.3 with exceptions to read as follows: 
 
910.2.3 Group H. Buildings and portions thereof used as a Group H occupancy as follows:  
 

1. In occupancies classified as Group H-2 or H-3, any of which are more than 15,000 square feet 
(1394 m2) in single floor area. 

 
Exception: Buildings of noncombustible construction containing only noncombustible materials. 

 
2. In areas of buildings in Group H used for storing Class 2, 3, and 4 liquid and solid oxidizers, 

Class 1 and unclassified detonable organic peroxides, Class 3 and 4 unstable (reactive) 
materials, or Class 2 or 3 water-reactive materials as required for a high-hazard commodity 
classification.  

 
Exception: Buildings of noncombustible construction containing only noncombustible materials. 

 
(Reason: Maintains a fire protection device utilized in such occupancies where it is sometimes necessary 
to allow chemicals to burn out, rather than extinguish.) 

 
**Section 910.3; add section 910.3.4 to read as follows: 
 
910.3.4 Vent Operation. Smoke and heat vents shall be capable of being operated by approved 
automatic and manual means. Automatic operation of smoke and heat vents shall conform to the 
provisions of Sections 910.3.2.1 through 910.3.2.3. 

 



 

North Central Texas Council of Governments           16 Approved September 2018 
Amendments / (+City Amendment Sept. 2023)  2018 International Building Code  

 910.3.4.1 Sprinklered buildings. Where installed in buildings equipped with an approved automatic 
sprinkler system, smoke and heat vents shall be designed to operate automatically.  
The automatic operating mechanism of the smoke and heat vents shall operate at a temperature rating at 
least 100 degrees F (approximately 38 degrees Celsius) greater than the temperature rating of the 
sprinklers installed. 
 
Exception:  Manual only systems per Section 910.2. 
 
910.3.4.2 Nonsprinklered Buildings. Where installed in buildings not equipped with an approved 
automatic sprinkler system, smoke and heat vents shall operate automatically by actuation of a heat-
responsive device rated at between 100°F (56°C) and 220°F (122°C) above ambient. 

Exception: Listed gravity-operated drop out vents. 
 
(Reason: Amendment continues to keep applicable wording from prior to the 2012 edition of the IFC.  
Specifically, automatic activation criteria is no longer specifically required in the published code.  
Specifying a temperature range at which smoke and heat vents should activate in sprinklered buildings 
helps to ensure that the sprinkler system has an opportunity to activate and control the fire prior to vent 
operation.) 

 
**Section 910.4.3.1; change to read as follows: 
 
910.4.3.1 Makeup Air.  Makeup air openings shall be provided within 6 feet (1829 mm) of the floor level. 
Operation of makeup air openings shall be manual or automatic. The minimum gross area of makeup air 
inlets shall be 8 square feet per 1,000 cubic feet per minute (0.74 m2 per 0.4719 m3/s) of smoke exhaust. 
 
(Reason:  Makeup air has been required to be automatic for several years now in this region when 
mechanical smoke exhaust systems are proposed.  This allows such systems to be activated from the 
smoke control panel by first responders without having to physically go around the exterior of the building 
opening doors manually.  Such requires a significant number of first responders on scene to conduct this 
operation and significantly delays activation and/or capability of the smoke exhaust system.) 

 
**Section 912.2; add Section 912.2.3 to read as follows: 
 
912.2.3 Hydrant Distance. An approved fire hydrant shall be located within 100 feet of the fire 
department connection as the fire hose lays along an unobstructed path.  
 
(Reason:  To accommodate limited hose lengths, improve response times where the FDC is needed to 
achieve fire control, and improve ease of locating a fire hydrant in those situations also.  Also, consistent 
with NFPA 14 criteria.) 

 
***Section 913.2.1; add Section 913.2.1.1 and exception to read as follows: 
 
913.2.1.1 Fire Pump Room Access. When located on the ground level at an exterior wall, the fire pump 
room shall be provided with an exterior fire department access door that is not less than 3 ft. in width and 
6 ft. – 8 in. in height, regardless of any interior doors that are provided.  A key box shall be provided at 
this door, as required by IFC Section 506.1. 
 

Exception:  When it is necessary to locate the fire pump room on other levels or not at an exterior 
wall, the corridor leading to the fire pump room access from the exterior of the building shall be 
provided with equivalent fire resistance as that required for the pump room, or as approved by the fire 
code official.  Access keys shall be provided in the key box as required by IFC Section 506.1. 

 



 

North Central Texas Council of Governments           17 Approved September 2018 
Amendments / (+City Amendment Sept. 2023)  2018 International Building Code  

(Reason:  This requirement allows fire fighters safer access to the fire pump room.  The requirement 
allows access without being required to enter the building and locate the fire pump room interior access 
door during a fire event. The exception recognizes that this will not always be a feasible design scenario 
for some buildings, and as such, provides an acceptable alternative to protect the pathway to the fire 
pump room.)  
 
**Section 1006.2.2.7; add Section 1006.2.2.7 as follows:  
 
1006.2.2.7 Electrical Rooms. For electrical rooms, special exiting requirements may apply. Reference 
the electrical code as adopted.  
   
(Reason: Cross reference necessary for coordination with the NEC which has exiting requirements as 
well.) 
 
**Section 1009.8; add the following Exception 7:  
 
1009.8 Two Way Communication. A two-way communication system complying with Sections 1009.8.1 
and 1009.8.2 shall be provided at the landing serving each elevator required to be accessible on each 
accessible floor that is one or more stories above or below the level of exit discharge. 
  
Exceptions: 
7. Buildings regulated under State Law and built in accordance with State registered plans, including 
variances or waivers granted by the State, shall be deemed to be in compliance with the requirements of 
Section 1009 and chapter 11. 
 
(Reason: To accommodate buildings regulated under Texas State Law and to be consistent with 
amendments in Chapter 11.)  
 
**Section 1010.1.9.5 Bolt Locks; amend exceptions 3 and 4 as follows: 
  
Exceptions: 
3. Where a pair of doors serves an occupant load of less than 50 persons in a Group B, F, M or S 
occupancy. (remainder unchanged) 
4. Where a pair of doors serves a Group A, B, F, M or S occupancy (remainder unchanged) 
 
(Reason: Application to M occupancies reflects regional practice; No. 4 expanded to Group A due to it 
being a similar scenario to other uses; No. 4 was regional practice.) 

 
**Section 1020.1 Construction; add exception 6 to read as follows: 
 
6. In group B occupancies, corridor walls and ceilings need not be of fire-resistive construction within a 
single tenant space when the space is equipped with approved automatic smoke-detection within the 
corridor. The actuation of any detector must activate self-annunciating alarms audible in all areas within 
the corridor. Smoke detectors must be connected to an approved automatic fire alarm system where such 
system is provided.  
 
(Reason: Regionally accepted alternate method.) 

 
**Section 1029.1.1.1 Spaces under grandstands and bleachers; delete this section. 
 
(Reason: Unenforceable.) 

 
**Section 1101.1 Scope; add exception to Section 1101.1 as follows: 



 

North Central Texas Council of Governments           18 Approved September 2018 
Amendments / (+City Amendment Sept. 2023)  2018 International Building Code  

 
Exception: Components of projects regulated by and registered with Architectural Barriers Division of 
Texas Department of Licensing and Regulation shall be deemed to be in compliance with the 
requirements of this chapter. 
 
(Reason: To accommodate buildings regulated under state law. Further clarified in 2015 to mean 
components that are specifically addressed by TDLR shall be exempt.) 

 
 
 
**Section 2901.1; add a sentence to read as follows:  
   
[P] 2901.1 Scope. {existing text to remain} The provisions of this Chapter are meant to work in 
coordination with the provisions of Chapter 4 of the International Plumbing Code. Should any conflicts 
arise between the two chapters, the Building Official shall determine which provision applies. 
 
(Reason: Gives building official discretion.) 
 
**Section 2902.1; add a second paragraph to read as follows: 
 
In other than E Occupancies, the minimum number of fixtures in Table 2902.1 may be lowered, if 
requested in writing, by the applicant stating reasons for a reduced number and approved by the Building 
Official.  
 
(Reason: To allow flexibility for designer to consider specific occupancy needs.) 
 
**Table 2902.1; add footnote g to read as follows: 
 
g. Drinking fountains are not required in M Occupancies with an occupant load of 100 or less, B 
Occupancies with an occupant load of 25 or less, and for dining and/or drinking establishments.  
 
(Reason: Adjustment meets the needs of specific occupancy types.)  
 
**Add new Section 2902.1.4 to read as follows:  
 
2902.1.4 Additional fixtures for food preparation facilities. In addition to the fixtures required in this 
Chapter, all food service facilities shall be provided with additional fixtures set out in this section.  
 
2902.1.4.1 Hand washing lavatory. At least one hand washing lavatory shall be provided for use by 
employees that is accessible from food preparation, food dispensing and ware washing areas. Additional 
hand washing lavatories may be required based on convenience of use by employees.  
 
2902.1.4.2 Service sink. In new or remodeled food service establishments, at least one service sink or 
one floor sink shall be provided so that it is conveniently located for the cleaning of mops or similar wet 
floor cleaning tool and for the disposal of mop water and similar liquid waste. The location of the service 
sink(s) and/or mop sink(s) shall be approved by the <Jurisdiction’s> health department.  
 
(Reason: Coordinates Health law requirements with code language for consistent regional practice.) 

 
***Section 3001.2 Emergency Elevator Communication Systems for the deaf, hard of hearing and 
speech impaired; delete this section. 
  
(Reason: Per Elevator manufacturers input, they were not consulted prior to code approval and 
technology of elevator provisions as submitted are not currently available to provide this feature.) 

 



 

North Central Texas Council of Governments           19 Approved September 2018 
Amendments / (+City Amendment Sept. 2023)  2018 International Building Code  

***Section 3002.1 Hoistway Enclosure Protection required. Add exceptions to Section 3002.1 as 
follows:  
 
Exceptions: 
 

4.   Elevators completely located within atriums shall not require hoistway enclosure protection.  
 

5.  Elevators in open or enclosed parking garages that serve only the parking garage, shall not 
require hoistway enclosure protection.  

   
(Reason: Provides specific Code recognition that elevators within atriums and within parking garages do 
not require hoistway enclosure protection. Amendment needed since specific Code language does not 
currently exist.)  

 
**Section 3005.4 Machine rooms, control rooms, machinery spaces and control spaces; delete text 
as follows:  
 
Elevator machine rooms, control rooms, control spaces and machinery spaces outside of but attached to 
a hoistway that have openings into the hoistway shall be enclosed with fire barriers constructed in 
accordance with Section 707 or horizontal assemblies constructed in accordance with Section 711, or 
both. 
 
Revise text to read: 
 
Elevator machine rooms, control rooms, control spaces and machinery spaces shall be enclosed with fire 
barriers constructed in accordance with Section 707 or horizontal assemblies constructed in accordance 
with Section 711, or both.  
 
(Remainder unchanged) 
   
(Reason: This amendment eliminates code language to be consistent with the regional goal to require 
passive enclosures of these areas unless a hoistway enclosure is not required by other Code provisions. 
See companion change to eliminate fire sprinklers thereby eliminating shunt trip.)   

 
***Section 3005.4 Machine rooms, control rooms, machinery spaces and control spaces; 
Delete exceptions and add two new exceptions to Section 3005.4 as follows:   
   
Exceptions: 
 

      1.  Elevator machine rooms, control rooms, machinery spaces and control spaces completely 
located within atriums shall not require enclosure protection.  

 
2. Elevator machine rooms, control rooms, machinery spaces and control spaces in open or 
enclosed parking garages that serve only the parking garage, shall not require enclosure 
protection. 
 

(Reason: This amendment eliminates the Exceptions to Section 3005.4 such that passive enclosures for 
these areas are to be provided and maintained. The fire rating of these enclosures is permitted to be 
omitted by the above added exceptions where allowed by other provisions of the code such as in atriums 
and parking structures. See companion change to eliminate fire sprinklers to eliminate the need for shunt 
trip system.) 

 
**Section 3005.7 add a Section 3005.7 as follows: 



 

North Central Texas Council of Governments           20 Approved September 2018 
Amendments / (+City Amendment Sept. 2023)  2018 International Building Code  

 
3005.7 Fire Protection in Machine rooms, control rooms, machinery spaces and control spaces.  
 
3005.7.1 Automatic sprinkler system. The building shall be equipped throughout with an automatic 
sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1, except as otherwise permitted by Section 
903.3.1.1.1 and as prohibited by Section 3005.7.2.1. 
 
3005.7.2.1 Prohibited locations. Automatic sprinklers shall not be installed in machine rooms, elevator 
machinery spaces, control rooms, control spaces and elevator hoistways.  
 
3005.7.2.2 Sprinkler system monitoring.  The sprinkler system shall have a sprinkler control valve 
supervisory switch and water-flow initiating device provided for each floor that is monitored by the 
building’s fire alarm system. 
 
3005.7.3 Water protection. An approved method to prevent water from infiltrating into the hoistway 
enclosure from the operation of the automatic sprinkler system outside the elevator lobby shall be 
provided. 
 
3005.7.4 Shunt trip. Means for elevator shutdown in accordance with Section 3005.5 shall not be 
installed. 
 
(Reason: Firefighter and public safety. This amendment eliminates the shunt trip requirement of the 
International Building Code Section 3005.5 for the purpose of elevator passenger and firefighter safety. 
The new section above is intended to be identical to Sections 3007.2, 3007.3, and 3007.4 for Fire Service 
Access Elevators and Sections 3008.2, 3008.3 and 3008.4 for Occupant Evacuation Elevators.) 

 
**Section 3005.8; add Section 3005.8 as follows: 
 
3005.8 Storage. Storage shall not be allowed within the elevator machine room, control room, machinery 
spaces and or control spaces. Provide approved signage at each entry to the above listed locations 
stating: "No Storage Allowed. 
 
(Reason: Reinforces the need to maintain space clean and free of combustibles. See companion change 
to eliminate fire sprinklers therein, to always require an enclosure - with IBC 3005.4 exceptions deleted - 
resulting in the limited need for a shunt trip system.) 

 
 

Option A 
Section 3006.2, Hoistway opening protection required; Revise text as follows: 
 
 
5. The building is a high rise and the elevator hoistway is more than 75 feet (22 860 mm) in height. The 
height of the hoistway shall be measured from the lowest floor at or above grade to the highest floors 
served by the hoistway.”  
  

 

Option B 
Section 3006.2, Hoistway opening protection required; Revise text as follows: 
 
 



 

North Central Texas Council of Governments           21 Approved September 2018 
Amendments / (+City Amendment Sept. 2023)  2018 International Building Code  

5. The building is a high rise and the elevator hoistway is more than 75 feet (22 860 mm) 55 feet (16 764 
mm) in height. The height of the hoistway shall be measured from the lowest floor at or above grade to 
the highest floors served by the hoistway.”  
 

 
(Reason: 2018 IBC text does not address hoistways that are greater than 75’-0” in height that are both 
below grade and above grade but not located above the high rise classification nor does the IBC address 
hoistways wholly located above grade such as those that serve sky lobbies".)   
 
 

End 



/ 

North Central Texas 

Council of Governments 

Recommended Amendments to the 

2018 International Residential Code 

North Central Texas Council of Governments Region 

The following sections, paragraphs, and sentences of the 2018 International Residential Code are hereby 
amended as follows: Standard type is text from the IRC. Underlined type is text inserted. biReEI tllre�gll 
ty�e is EleleteEI text ffeFR IRC. A double asterisk at the beginning of a section identifies an amendment 
carried over from the 2015 edition of the code and a triple asterisk identifies a new or revised amendment 
with the 2018 code. 

In 2009, the State Legislature enacted SB 1410 prohibiting cities from enacting fire sprinkler 
mandates in residential dwellings. However, jurisdictions with ordinances that required sprinklers for 
residential dwellings prior to and enforced before January 1, 2009, may remain in place. Reference; 
Section R313 Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems. 

The energy provisions in IRC Chapter 11 is deleted in its entirety. 
Reference the 2018 IECC for energy.._2\!de :r:irovisions and recommended amendments. 

," ,, ' ' ' 

**Section R102.4; change to read as follows:

R102.4 Referenced codes and standards. The codes, when specifically adopted. and standards 
referenced in this code shall be considered part of the requirements of this code to the prescribed extent 
of each such reference and as further regulated in Sections R102.4.1 and R102.4.2. Whenever 
amendments have been adopted to the referenced codes and standards, each reference to said code 
and standard shall be considered to reference the amendments as well. Any reference made to NFPA 70 
or the Electrical Code shall mean the Electrical Code as adopted. 

(Reason: Legal wording to recognize locally adopted codes and amendments adopted with referenced 
codes. 

** Section R103 and R103.1 amend to insert the Department Name 

City of Quinlan Building Department 

R103.1 Creation of enforcement agency. City of Quinlan Building Department 
is hereby created and the official in charge thereof shall be known as the building official. 

Reason: Reminder to be sure ordinance reads the same as designated by the ci�,-'.
'-

------
� 

**Section R104.10.1 Flood Hazard areas; delete this section.

Reason: Flood hazard ordinances ma be administered b)I other departments within the city. . . ·>· , ..• :·" ;,F . . .... �.---� 

**Section R105.3.1.1& R106.1.4; delete these sections. 

**Section R110 (R110.1 through R110.5); delete the section. 

**Section R202; change definition of "Townhouse" to read as follows:

North Central Texas Council of Governments 
Amendments 

1 Approved September 2018 
2018 lnJernational Residential Code 

Exhibit A, Section A-2 
2018 IRC Local Amendments 
Adopted 9-11-23 























Recommended Amendments to the 

2017 National Electrical Code 

North Central Texas Council of Governments 

" 

The following articles, paragraphs, and sentences of the 2017 National Electrical Code (NEC1 
are hereby amended as follows: Standard type is text from the NEC. Highlighted with gra}i 
shading is text inserted.I Lines thre!lgh ty13e is seletes telCt frem NEC. A double asterisk (**) at 
the beginning of an article identifies an amendment carried over from the 2014 edition of the 
code and a triple asterisk (***) identifies a new or revised amendment with the 2017 code. 

**Article 100; add the following to definitions: 

)=ngineering .Supervision. Supervision by a Qualified State'of Texas Licensed 8rofessional 
Engineer eng�ged Rrimarily in the design or-rilaintfil)ance of electrical installations. 

I 
(REASON FOR CHANGE: To better define the qualifications for engineering supervision. This 
term. is used twenty four times in the 2017 Natipnal Electrical Code.) 

***Article 100; remove the amendment to the following definition: 

lntersystem Bonding Termination. A device that provides a means for connecting intersystem 
bonding conductors for communication systems ans ether systems s!lsh as metallis gas 13i� 
systems to the grounding electrode system. Bensing sens!lGters fer ether systems shall net ee
lal'§er than e NN?I! 

(REASON FOR CHANGE: Remove the above amendment, lJpdates to the:2017 National
Electrical-Code Article "250.94(A) only accommodate connecting communication systems Tri ail 
1ntersystem bonding termination device, but Article 250. 94@LR.rovides an alternative or othe( 
means! Te a!kwi fer a termiRatisR psiRt fer slher l!eREliR€J seREhis/Grs iR aefiilieR Is 
semmooisatieR s,<slems that are refif/Jirefi e�' the •,rarieus mefie! sefies. fj AW{; v,ras GheseR ts 
pe.iRG.ifie w.ilh /he miR.imum. s.ize sfl!oofiiRg seREhister reffukefi Is /he iRlersy.slem l!eRfiiRg 
jY!!Jl3_g[) 

**Article 110.2; change the following to read as follows: 

110.2 Approval. The conductors and equipment required or permitted by this Code shall be 
acceptable only if approved. Approval of equipment may be evident by listing and labeling of 
equipment by a Nationally Recognized Testing Lab (NRTL) with a certification mark of that 
laboratory or a qualified third party inspection agency approved by the AHJ. 

North Central Texas Council of Governments 1 

2017 NEC Regional Amendments 

Exhibit A, Section A-3 
2017 NEC Local Amendments 
Adopted 9-11-23 















North Central Texas 

Council of Governments 

Recommended Amendments to the 

2018 International Fuel Gas Code 
North Central Texas Council of Governments Region 

The following sections, paragraphs, and sentences of the 2018 I n ternational Fuel Gas Code are hereby 
amended as follows: Standard type is text from the IFGC. Underlined type is text inserted. liRee IAFe�!JA 
ly'3e is eelelee leiEt from IFGC. A double asterisk at the beginning of a section identifies an amendment 
carried over from the 2015 edition of the code and a triple asterisk identifies a new or revised amendment 
with the 2018 code. 

**Section 101.2 
{Local amendments to Section 101. 2 may be necess ary to corres pond with the State Plumbing 
Licensing Law.} 

'l . l 
**Section 102.2; add an exception to read as follows: 

Exception: Existing dll)elling units shall comply with Section 621.2. 

(Reas on: Previous code provis ions made unvented heater provisio ns retroactive except as provided for
in local amendment. This am endment a nd ame n dment to IFGC 621.2 better clarify what the code 
a/read s tates : existing systems may stay,-"-u"'nl;.;;e.,;�-=-s..o.c-=-o"-ns"'i-"-d-=-e n'-'e"'d'-'u"'n""s'-'a"-fe'-'.'-l-------,-----�

: . 

**Section 102.B; change to read as follows: 

102.8 Referenced codes and· standards. The codes and standards referenced in this code shall be 
those that are listed in Chapter 8 and such codes, when specifically adopted, and standards shall be 
considered part of.the requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of each such reference. Where 
differences occur between provisions of this code and the referenced standards, the provisions of this 
code shall apply. Whenever amendments have been adopted to the referenced codes and standards, 
each reference to said code and standard shall be considered to reference the amendments as well. Any 
reference to NFPA 70 or the ICC Electrica l Code shall mean the Electrical Code as adopted. 

(Rea son: Legal· wording to rocognize locally adopted codes and amendments a dopted with referenced 

codes. 

***Section 306.3; change to read as follows: 

[Ml 306.3 Appliances in attics. Attics containing appliances shall be provided ... {bulk of pa ragraph
unchanged} ... side of the appliance . The clear access opening dimensions shall be· a minimum of 20 
inches by 30 inches (508 mm by 762 mm), and large enough to allow removal of the largest appliance.
As a minimum, for access to the attic space, provide one of the following: 

1. A permanent stair.

2. A pull down stair with a minimum 300 lb (136 kg) capacity.

3. An access door from an upper floor level.

4. Acces s Panel may be used in lieu of items 1, 2, and 3 with prior approval of the code official due
to building conditions.

North Central Texas Council of Governments 
Amendments 

1 Approved September 2018 
2018 International Fuel Gas Code 

Exhibit A, Section A-4 
2018 IFGC Local Amendments 
Adopted 9-11-23









North Central Texas 

Council of Governments 

Recommended Amendments to the 

2018 International Mechanical Code 

North Central Texas Council of Governments Region 

The following sections, paragraphs, and sentences of the 2018 International Mechanical Code (IMC) are 
hereby amended as follows: Standard type is text from the IMC. Underlined type is text inserted. biReG 
through type is deleted text from the IMC. A double asterisk at the beginning of a section identifies an 
amendment carried over from the 2015 edition of the code and a triple asterisk identifies a new or revised 
amendment of the 2018 edition of the code. 

Note: Historically the North Central Texas Council of Governments (NCTCOG) has limited Chapter 1 
amendments in order to allow each city to insert their local policies and procedures. We now have 
suggested certain items to be brought to the attention of cities considering adoption of the code that may 
be of concern to several jurisdictions. It is still intended to be discretionary to each city to determine 
which Chapter 1 amendments to include. I 

***Section 102.8; change to read as follows: 

102.8 Referenced Codes and Standards. The codes and standards referenced herein shall be those 
that are listed in Chapter 15 and such codes, when specifically adopted, and standards shall be 
considered part of the requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of each such reference. Where 
differences occur between provisions of this code and the referenced standards, the provisions of this 
code shall apply. Whenever amendments have been adopted to the referenced codes and standards, 
each reference to said code and standard shall be considered to reference the adopted amendments. 
Any reference to NFPA 70 shall mean the Electrical Code as adopted. 

(Reason: Legal wording to recognize locally adopted codes and amendments adopted with referenced 
codes) 

***Section 306.3; change to read as follows: 

306.3 Appliances in Attics. Attics containing appliances shall be provided . . . {bulk of paragraph 
unchanged} ... side of the appliance. The clear access opening dimensions shall be a minimum of 
20 inches by 30 inches (508 mm by 762 mm}, and large enough to allow removal of the largest appliance. 
As a minimum, for access to the attic space. provide one of the following: 

1. A permanent stair.

2. A pull-down stair with a minimum 300 lb. (136 kg) capacity.

3. An access door from an upper floor level.

4. Access Panel may be used in lieu of items 1, 2. and 3 with prior approval of the code official due
to building conditions.

Exceptions:

1. The passageway and level service space are not required where the appliance is capable
of being serviced and removed ... {remainder of section unchanged}

North Central Texas Council of Governments 
Amendments 

Approved September 2018 
2018 International Mechanical Code 

Exhibit A, Section A-5 
2018 IMC Local Amendments 
Adopted 9-11-23







North Central Texas 

Council of Governments 

Recommended Amendments to the 
2018 International Plumbing Code 

North Central Texas Council of Governments Region 

The following sections, paragraphs; and sentences of the 2018 International Plumbing Code are hereby 
amended as follows: Standard type is text from the IPC. Underlined type is text inserted. biReEl thre�!Jh 
ty�e is EleleteEl tel<! frem the IPC. A double asterisk at the beginning of a section identifies an amendment 
carried over from the 2015 edition of the code and a triple asterisk identifies a new or revised amendment 
with the 2018 edition of the code. 

Note: Historically NCTCOG has limited Chapter 1 amendments in order to allow each city to insert their 
local policies and procedures. We now have suggested certain items to be brought to the attention of 
cities considering adoption of the code that may be of concern to several jurisdictions. It is still intended 
to be 1iscretionary to each city to determine which Chapter 1 a[:!!endments to in�lude.

-rable of Contents, Chapter 7, Section 714; change to read as follows:
1 i 

714 Engineered Cem��terizeEl Drainage Design ................... 69 

(Reason: Editorial change to make compatible with amendment to Section 714. 1.) 

-•section 102.8; change to read as follows:

102.8 Referenced codes and standards. The codes and standards referenced in this code shall be
those that are listed in Chapter 15 and such codes, when specifically adopted, and standards shall be 
considered as part of the requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of each such reference. 
Where the differences occur between provisions of this code and the referenced standards, the 
provisions of this code shall be the minimum requirements. Whenever amendments have been adopted 
to the referenced codes and standards, each reference to said code and standard shall be considered to 
reference the adopted amendments. Any reference to NFPA 70 shall mean the Electrical Code as 
adopted. 

(Reason: Legal wording to recognize locally adopted codes and amendments adopted with referenced 
codes.) 

-sections 106.6.2 and 106.6.3; change to read as follows:

106.6.2 Fee schedule. The fees for all plumbing work shall be as iRElisaleEl iR the lellewiR!J ssheEl�le:
(JURISrnCTIOM TO l�ISERT /\PPROPRI/\TE SClalEDULE) adopted by resolution of the governing body 
of the iurisdiction. 

106.6.3 Fee Refunds. The code official shall establish a policy for a�therize authorizing the refunding of
fees as lellaws. {Delete balance of section} 

(Reason: This calls to attention of local jurisdictions considering adoption that they need a fee schedule
and a refund policy.) 

· · 

North Central Texas Council of Governments 
Amendments 

1 Approved September 2018 IPC 
2018 International Plumbing Code 

Exhibit A, Section A-6 
2018 IPC Local Amendments 
Adopted 9-11-23

















Amendments to 2018 International Property Maintenance Code 

Preface to Amendments to 2018 International Property Maintenance Code. The governing 

regulations are the 2018 International Property Maintenance Code, and the amendments 

described below. In the event of a conflict with the 2015 International Property Maintenance 

Code and any of the amendments, the amendment shall control. 

Section 101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Property Maintenance Code 

of the City of Quinlan, Texas, hereinafter referred to as "this code". 

Section 101.3 Intent. This code shall be construed to secure its expressed intent, which is 

to ensure public health, safety and welfare, insofar as they are affected by the continued 

occupancy and maintenance of structures and premises. Existing structures and premises 

that do not comply with these provisions shall be altered or repaired to provide a minimum 

level of health and safety as required herein. Repairs, alterations, additions to and change 

of occupancy in existing buildings shall comply with the City of Quinlan's Building, Electrical, 

Mechanical, Plumbing, Fire, and Health Codes, as they currently exist or may be amended, 

and the City of Quinlan Zoning and Subdivision Ordinances, as they currently exist or may be 

amended. 

Section 102.3 Application of other Codes. Repairs, additions or alterations to a structure, 

or changes of occupancy, shall be done in accordance with the procedures and provisions 

of the City of Quinlan Building, Electrical, Mechanical, Plumbing, Fire, and Health & Sanitation 

Codes as they currently exist or may be amended, and the City of Quinlan Zoning and 

Subdivision Ordinances, as they currently exist or may be amended. Nothing in this code 

shall be construed to cancel, modify or set aside any provision of the International Zoning 

Code City of Quinlan Zoning and/or Subdivision Ordinances, as they currently exist or may 

be amended. Likewise, if there is a conflict between this code and Section 3.12, "Vacant and 

Substandard Structures," of Chapter 3, "Building Regulations," of the City of Quinlan's Code 

of Ordinances; Section 3.12 "Vacant and Substandard Structures" of Chapter 3, "Building 

Regulations," of the City of Quinlan's Code of Ordinances, shall exclusively control. 

Section 103.5 Fees. The fees for activities and services performed by the department 
carrying out its responsibilities under this code shall be as indicated in the following schedule 
Appendix A of the City of Quinlan Code of Ordinances as it currently exists or may be 
amended. 

112.4 Failure to comply.  Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with 
a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation 
or unsafe condition, shall be liable to a fine not less than (AMOUNT) dollars or more than 
(AMOUNT) dollars as provided by the City of Quinlan Ordinances and as allowed by other laws. 

Section 302.4 Weeds. Premises and exterior property shall be maintained free from grass 

and weeds in excess of twelve (12) inches, and from any other vegetation that creates a 

nuisance and shall meet the requirements as defined in the City of Quinlan Code of 

Ordinances, as it currently exists or may be amended. Vegetation shall exclude regularly 

cultivated flowers and gardens located on private property. Required landscape areas shall 

be maintained. Trees and shrubs and the like shall be maintained. Vegetation shall not 

encroach into a pedestrian walkway or vehicular traveled way nor shall they impede visibility 

Exhibit A, Section A-7 
2018 IPMC Local Amendments 
Adopted 9-11-23



 

in site triangles at intersections or driveways. Landscape beds not maintained shall be 

presumed to be a nuisance, objectionable, unsanitary, and unsightly. 
 

Upon failure of the property owner having ownership of a property when the violation was 

initially observed and requested to abate said violation after service of a notice of violation, 

the owner shall be subject to prosecution in accordance with Section 106.4 and as prescribed 

by the City of Quinlan. Upon failure to comply with the notice of violation, any duly authorized 

employee or official of the City of Quinlan or agent hired by the City of Quinlan shall be 

authorized to enter upon the property in violation and correct the violation thereon. All costs of 

such corrections shall be reimbursed to the City of Quinlan by the owner responsible for the 

property at the rates and fees referenced in Section 106.4.  Interest shall accrue until fee is 

reimbursed for services rendered. 

 

Section 304.14 Insect Screens. During the period from (DATE) to (DATE) At all times, every 

door, window and other outside opening required for ventilation of habitable rooms, food 

preparation areas, food service areas, or any areas where products to be included or utilized 

in food for human consumption are processed, manufactured, packaged or stored, shall be 

supplied with approved tightly fitting screens of not less than 16 mesh per inch (16 mesh per 

25 mm), and every swinging door shall have a self-closing device in good working condition  

 
Section 308.2. Disposal of Garbage. Every occupant of a structure shall dispose of 

garbage, trash and/or any other debris in a clean and sanitary manner by placing such 

garbage, trash and other debris into a municipality approved garbage container for disposal 

to dispose of garbage, trash, and other debris, as required by the Code of Ordinances. 

 
Section 308.3.1 Garbage Facilities.  The owner of every dwelling shall supply one of the 

following: an approved mechanical food waste grinder in each dwelling unit; an approved 

incinerator unit in the structure available to the occupants in each dwelling unit; or an 

approved leakproof, covered, outside garbage container.  

 

308.3.2 Containers. The operator of every establishment producing garbage shall provide, 

and at all times cause to be utilized, approved leakproof containers provided with close-fitting 

covers for the storage of such materials until removed from the premises for disposal.  

 
Section 602.2 Residential Occupancies. Dwellings shall be provided with heating facilities 

capable of maintaining a room temperature of sixty-eight degrees Fahrenheit (68°F), or 

twenty degrees Celsius (20°C), in all habitable rooms, bathrooms and toilet rooms based on 

the winter outdoor design temperature for the locality indicated in Appendix D of the 

International Plumbing Code. Cooking appliances shall not be used to provide space heating 

to meet the requirements of this Section. Space heaters shall not be used as a primary source 

to provide heat for habitable rooms, bathrooms and toilet rooms. 

 
Section 602.3 Heat Supply. Every owner and operator of any building who rents, leases or 

lets on or more dwelling units or sleeping units on terms, either expressed or implied, to 

furnish heat to the occupants thereof shall supply heat during the period from (DATE) to 

(DATE) at all times able to maintain a minimum temperature of 68 deg. F (20 deg C) in all 

habitable rooms, bathrooms and toilet rooms. 

 
Section 602.4 Occupiable Work Spaces. Indoor occupied work spaces shall be supplied 

with heat during the period from (DATE) to (DATE) at all times to maintain a temperature of not 

less than sixty-five degrees Fahrenheit (65°F), or eighteen degrees Celsius (18°C), during 

the period the spaces are occupied. All 'Exceptions' listed in this Section are included. 



 

 
Section 701.2 Responsibility. The owner of the premises shall provide and maintain such 

fire safety facilities and equipment in compliance with these requirements and with applicable 

requirements of the City of Quinlan's Fire Code and Building Codes, as they currently exist 

or may be amended. A person shall not occupy as an owner, occupant or permit another 

person to occupy any premises that do not comply with the requirements of this chapter and 

other adopted codes. 

 
Chapter 8 - Referenced Standards. References standards listed below shall also include 

the City of Quinlan's Zoning and Subdivision Ordinances as they currently exist or may be 

amended, and any other ordinances or codes adopted by the City of Quinlan, as they 

currently exist or may be amended. The City of Quinlan rescinds reference to the International 

Zoning Code. 



North Central Texas 

Council of Governments 

Recommended Amendments to the 

2018 International Fire Code 

North Central Texas Council of Governments Region 

The following sections, paragraphs, and sentences of the 2018 International Fire Code (IFC) are hereby 
amended as follows: Standard type is text from the IFC. Underlined type is text inserted. Lined through 
type is deleted text from IFC. A double asterisk(**) at the beginning of a section identifies an amendment 
carried over from the 2015 edition of the code and a triple asterisk (***) identifies a new or revised 
amendment with the 2018 code. 

Note: Historically, the North Central Texas Council of Governments (NCTCOG) has limited Chapter 1 
amendments in order to allow each city to insert their local policies and procedures. We now have 
suggested certain items to be brought to the attention of cities considering adoption of the code that may 
be of concern to several jurisdictions. It is still intended to be discretionary to each city to determine
which Chapter 1 amendments to include. Note that Appendices must be specifically adopted by 
Ordinance. As per Page vii of the 2018 I FC, note that several sections of the code require jurisdidonal 
specificity as to dollar amounts, geographic limits, etc. and are not addressed in these amendments. 

Explanation of Options A and B: 
Please note that as there is a wide range in firefighting philosophies/capabilities of cities across the 
region, OPTIONS "A" and "B" are provided in the Fire and Building Code amendments. Jurisdictions 
should choose one of these based on their fire-fighting philosophies/capabilities when adopting code 
amendments. 

**Section 102.1; change #3 to read as follows: 

3. Existing structures, facilities, and conditions when required in Chapter 11 or in specific sections of
this code.

(Reason: To clarify that there are other provisions in the fire code applicable to existing buildings that are 
not located in Chapter 11, including but not limited to Section 505 Premises Identification.) 

**Section 105.3.3; change to read as follows: 

105.3.3 Occupancy Prohibited before Approval. The building or structure shall not be occupied prior to 
the fire code official issuing a permit when required and conducting associated inspections indicating the 
applicable provisions of this code have been met. 

(Reason: For clarity to allow for better understanding in areas not requmng such permits, such as 
unincorporated areas of counties. This amendment may be struck by a cityl_

**Section 105.7; add Section 105.7.26 to read as follows: 

105.7.26 Electronic access control systems. Construction permits are required for the installation or 
modification of an electronic access control system, as specified in Chapter 10. A separate construction 
permit is required for the installation or modification of a fire alarm system that may be connected to the 
access control system. Maintenance performed in accordance with this code is not considered a 

North Central Texas Council of Governments 
Amendments 

Approved September 2018 
2018 International Fire Code 

Exhibit A, Section A-8 
2018 IFC Local Amendments 

(Option A Selected) 
Adopted 9-11-23 





**Option A 

North Central Texas 

Council of Governments 

HIGH-PILED COMBUSTIBLE STORAGE: add a second paragraph to read as follows: 

Any_ building classified as a grou12 S Occu12ancy_ or S12eculative Building exceeding 12,000 sg. ft. that 
has a clear height in excess of 14 feet, making it 12ossible to be used for storage in excess of 12 feet, 
shall be considered to be high-Qiled storage. When a s12ecific 12roduct cannot be identified, a fire 
12rotection sy_stem and life safety_ features shall be installed as for Class IV commodities, to the 
maximum oile heiaht. 

**Option B 

HIGH-PILED dOMBUSTIBLE STORAGE: add a second paragraph to read as follows: 

Any_ building classified as a grou12 S Occu12ancy_ or S12eculative Building exceeding 6,000 sg. ft. that 
has a clear height in excess of 14 feet, making it 12ossible to be used for sto'rage in excess of 12 feet, 
shall be considered to be high-Qiled storage. When a s12ecific 12roduct cannot be identified, a fire 
12rotection sy_stem and life safety_ features shall be installed as for Class IV commodities, to the 
maximum Qile height. 

(Reason: To provide protection for worst-case scenario in flexible or unknown situations.) 

**Option A 

HIGH-RISE BUILDING. {No Change Required} 

**Option B 

HIGH-RISE BUILDING. A building with an occupied floor located more than -7a 55 feet (22 860 16 764 
mm) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access.

(Reason: Allows for additional construction safety features to be provided, based on firefighting response 
capabilities.) 

**REPAIR GARAGE. A building, structure or portion thereof used for servicing or repairing motor 
vehicles. This occu12ancy_ shall also include garages involved in minor re12air, modification and servicing of 
motor vehicles for items such as lube changes, ins12ections, windshield re12air or re12lacement, shocks, 
minor 12art re12lacement, and other such minor re12airs. 

(Reason: To further clarify types of service work allowed in a repair garage, as well as to correspond with
definition in the /BC.) 

**SELF-SERVICE STORAGE FACILITY. Real 12ro12erty_ designed and used for the Qumose of renting or 
leasing individual storage s12aces to customers for the 12ur12ose of storing and removing 12ersonal 12ro12erty_ 
on a self-service basis. 

(Reason: To provide a definition that does not exist in the code.) 

North Central Texas Council of Governments 
Amendments 

3 Approved September 2018 
2018 International Fire Code 

jadel
Oval















jadel
Oval





jadel
Oval









































North Central Texas 

Council of Governments 

Recommended Amendments to the 
2018 International Energy Conservation Code 

And the energy provisions of the 
2018 International Residential Code 

North Central Texas Council of Governments Region 
(Climate Zone 3 of the IECC) 

The following sections, paragraphs, and sentences of the 2018 International Energy Conservation Code 
(IECC) are hereby amended as follows: Standard type is text from the IECC. Underlined type is text 
inserted. Lined through type is deleted tm<t from IECC. A double (**) asterisk at the beginning of a section 
identifies an amendment carried over from the 2015 edition of the code and a triple (***) asterisk identifies 
a new or revised amendment with the 2018 code. Section numbers in parenthesis represent the 
corresponding numbers of the energy provisions of the 2018 International Residential Code for parallel
amendments. 

2018 IECC (Energy Provisions of the 2018 IRCJ 

**Section C102/R102 General; add Section C102.1.2 and R102.1.2 (N1101.4.1) to read as follows: 

C102.1.2 Alternative compliance. A building certified by a national, state, or local accredited energy 
efficiency program and determined by the Energy Systems Laboratory to be in compliance with the 
energy efficiency requirements of this section may, at the option of the Code Official, be considered in 
compliance. The United States Environmental Protection Agency's Energy Star Program certification of 
energy code equivalency shall be considered in compliance. 

R102.1.2 (N1101.4.1) Alternative compliance. A building certified by a national. state, or local 
accredited energy efficiency program and determined by the Energy Systems Laboratory to be in 
compliance with the energy efficiency requirements of this section may. at the option of the Code Official. 
be considered in compliance. The United States Environmental Protection Agency's Energy Star 
Program certification of energy code equivalency shall be considered in compliance. Regardless of the 
program or the path to compliance. each 1- and 2-family dwelling shall be tested for air and duct leakage 
as prescribed in Section R402.4.1.2 (N1102.4.1.2) and R403.3.3 {N1103.3.3) respectively. 

(Reason: This amendment is added to allow alternative compliance in accordance with Texas HB 1365, 
781h Legislature. Codified in Chapter 388 Texas Building Energy Performance Standards: §38B.003(i). 
The last sentence to Section R102.1.2 (N1101.4.1) was added to insure that every house is tested in 
accordance with the mandatory provisions of the codeJ 

Section R202 (N1101.6) Definitions; add the following definition: 

**PROJECTION FACTOR. The ratio of the horizontal depth of the overhang, eave or permanently 
attached shading device, divided by the distance measured vertically from the bottom of the fenestration 
glazing to the underside of the overhang, eave or permanently attached shading device. 

(Reason: The amendment to Section 402.3.2 (N1102.3.2) Glazed fenestration SHGC was proposed by 
the TAB. ESL determined the proposal to be not less restrictive than the 2015 /ECG. This added 
definition is necessary as part of that amendment. The amendment will provide additional options for 
SHGC selectior!L_ __ _ 

North Central Texas Council of 
Governments Amendments 

1 Approved September 2018 
2018 International Energy Conservation Code 

Exhibit A, Section A-9 
2018 IECC Local Amendments 
Adopted 9-11-23 



















( 

North Central Texas 

Council of Governments 

Recommended Amendments to the 2018 
International Existing Building Code 

North Central Texas Council of Governments Region 

The following sections, paragraphs, and sentences of the 2018 International Existing Building Code are
hereby amended as follows: Standard type is text from the IEBC. Underlined type is text inserted. hiReG 
IRFS�§R !y13e is clele!ecl text tram IEllC. A double asterisk (**) at the beginning of a section identifies an 
amendment carried over from the 2015 edition of the code and a triple asterisk(***) identifies a new or 
revised amendment with the 2018 code. 

**Section 102.4; change to read as follows: 

[A] 102.4 Referenced codes and standards. The codes, when specifically adopted, and standards
referenced in this code shall be considered part of the requirements of this code to the prescribed extent
of each such reference and as further regulated in Sections 102.4.1 and 102.4.2.

(Reason: To not inadvertently adopt other codes (i.e. Wild/and Urban Interface Code etc .. .) by 
reference.) 

I i-1 ;;.c.;;.c.;c.;..;.;..c.,'-----------�-------------------�

**Section 202; amend definition of Existing Building as follows: 

1 

Existing Building -A building, structure, or space. with an approved final inspection issued under a code 
edition which is at least 2 published code editions preceding the currently adopted building code; or a 
change of occupancy. 

**Section 202; amend definition of Existing Structure as follows: 

Existing Structure-A building. structure. or space, with an approved final inspection issued under a code 
edition which is at least 2 published code editions preceding the currently adopted building code: or a 
change of occupancy. 

Reason: To ,:ev,ent potential abuses in new construction and shelf building·�.s�. -·-�-------�

**Section 305.1; adds an exception to read as follows: 

Exception: Components of projects regulated by and registered with Architectural Barriers Division of 
Texas Department of Licensing and Regulation shall be deemed to be incompliance with the 
requirements of this chapter. 

Reason: To coordinate with the IEBC and State Law. 

**Section 305.4.2; add Number7 to the list of requirements as follows: 

7. At least one accessible family or assisted use toilet room shall be provided in accordance with

Chapter 11 of the International Building Code. 

Reason: Accessible toilet rooms should be available for disabled occup_ants. 
� 

***Section 401.3 Flood Hazard Areas; delete this section: 

***Section 405.2.5 Flood Hazard Areas; delete this section: 

Reason: Flood hazard ordinances ma be administered by other de 
-<��,,\��_(. "�� . ,·;;,.-: ' ' ':_. _ _;_};,·' } ,;1·,.,�: .. J:1�:-,:: '.,

' --

North Central Texas Council of Governments 
Amendments 

1 Approved September 2018 
2018 International Existing Building Code 

Exhibit A, Section A-10 
2018 IEBC Local Amendments 
Adopted 9-11-23 











North Central Texas Council of Governments 
Amendments 

1 Approved September 2018 
2018 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code 

 

Recommended Regional Amendments to the 
2018 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code 

North Central Texas Council of Governments Region 

The following sections, paragraphs, and sentences of the 2018 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code 
are hereby amended as follows: Standard type is text from the ISPSC. Underlined type is text inserted. 
Lined through type is deleted text from ISPSC. A triple asterisk (***) identifies a new or revised amendment 
with the 2018 ISPSC code. 

**Section 102.9; Change to read as follows: 

Section 102.9 Other laws. The provisions of this code shall not be deemed to nullify any provisions of 
local, state or federal law, to include but not limited to; 

1. Texas Department of State Health Services (TDSHS); Standards for Public Pools and Spas;

§285.181 through §285.208, (TDSHS rules do not apply to pools serving one- and
two family dwellings or townhouses). 

2. Texas Department of Licensing and Regulation (TDLR); 2012 Texas Accessibility
Standards (TAS), TAS provide the scoping and technical requirements for accessibility for
Swimming Pool, wading pools and spas and shall comply with 2012 TAS, Section 242.
(TAS rules do not apply to pools serving one- and two family dwellings or townhouses).

Exception: Elements regulated under Texas Department of Licensing and Regulation 
(TDLR) and built in accordance with TDLR approved plans, including any variances or 
waivers granted by the TDLR, shall be deemed to be in compliance with the requirements 
of this Chapter. 

(Reason: To clarify specific Texas statutes which regulate public pools and spas.) 

**Section 103.1; Change to read as follows: 

Section 103.1 Creation of enforcement agency. The Department of Building Safety City of Quinlan 
Building Department is hereby created and the official in charge thereof shall be known as the code 
official. City of Quinlan Building Department is hereby created and the official in charge thereof shall be 
known as the code official for operation and maintenance of any public swimming pool in accordance this 
code, local and state law. 

(Reason: Reminder to be sure ordinance reads the same as designed by the City & the operation of public 

pools is enforced through the City’s appropriate department procedure.) 

**Section 107.4; Delete entirely (covered by general provisions in Code of Ordinances): 

(Reason: Covered by general provisions of the Code of Ordinances.) 

**107.5; Change to read as follows: 

107.5 Stop work orders. Upon notice from the code official, work on any system that is being done contrary 
to the provisions of this code or in a dangerous or unsafe manner shall immediately cease. Such notice 
shall be in writing and shall be given to the owner of the property, or to the owner’s agent, or to the person 
doing the work. The notice shall state the conditions under which work is authorized to resume. Where an 
emergency exists, the code official shall not be required to give a written notice prior to  

Exhibit A, Section A-11 
2018 NEC ISPSC Amendments 
Adopted 9-11-23



North Central Texas Council of Governments  
Amendments 

2 Approved September 2018  
2018 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code 

 

 

 

stopping the work. Any person who shall continue any work in or about the structure after having been 
served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation 
or unsafe condition, shall be in violation of this code. liable to a fine of not less than [AMOUNT] dollars or 
more than [AMOUNT] dollars.  

 

(Reason: Covered by general provisions of the Municipal Code of Ordinances.) 

 
**Section 202; DEFINITIONS; insert definition; change to read as follows: 

 
[INSERT HEALTH DEPARTMENT NAME OF JURSIDICTION]: [INSERT HEALTH DEPARTMENT 
NAME OF JURSIDICTION] regulates the operation of public pools. Routine inspections on pools and spas 
open to the public are conducted to document compliance with the standards set forth in State law. 

 

(Reason: The operation of public pools is enforced through [INSERT HEALTH DEPARTMENT NAME OF 
JURSIDICTION] procedures.) 

 
***Section 305; Change to read as follows: 

 

305.1 General.  
The provisions of this section shall apply to the design of barriers for restricting entry into areas having 
pools and spas. In one-and two-family dwellings and townhouses, where spas or hot tubs are equipped 
with a lockable safety cover complying with ASTM F1346 and swimming pools are equipped with a powered 
safety cover that complies with ASTM F1346, the areas where those spas, hot tubs or pools are located 
shall not be required to comply with Sections 305.2 through 305.7. 
 
(Reason: To clarify requirements for dwellings and commercial properties and specific Texas statutes which 
regulate public pools and spas.) 

 
**Section 305.2; Change to read as follows: 

 

305.2 Outdoor swimming pools and spas. Outdoor pools and spas and indoor swimming pools shall 
be surrounded by a barrier that complies with Sections 305.2.1 through 305.7 and in accordance with the 
Texas Administrative Code, Texas Health and Safety Code 757 for public pools. 

 

(Reason: To clarify specific Texas statutes which regulate public pools and spas.) 

 
** Add subsection 305.2.7.1; to read as follows: 

 
305.2.7.1 Chain link fencing prohibited. Chain link fencing is not permitted as a barrier in public pools 
built after January 1, 1994. 

 

(Reason: To clarify specific Texas Health and Safety Code Chapter 757.003 (f).) 

 
**Section 305.4 structure wall as a barrier; Changes as follows: 
 

305.4 Structure wall as a barrier. Where a wall of a dwelling or structure of a one and two family dwelling 

or townhouse or its accessory structure serves as part of a barrier and where doors or windows provide 

direct access to the pool or spa through that wall, one of the following shall be required:  

 

https://codes.iccsafe.org/premium/document/linkit/ISPSC2018_Ch11_PromASTM_RefStdF1346_91_2010/995/11715724/text-id-11715782
https://codes.iccsafe.org/premium/document/linkit/ISPSC2018_Ch11_PromASTM_RefStdF1346_91_2010/995/11715724/text-id-11715782
https://codes.iccsafe.org/premium/document/linkit/ISPSC2018_Ch03_Sec305.2/995/11715724/text-id-11715782
https://codes.iccsafe.org/premium/document/linkit/ISPSC2018_Ch03_Sec305.7/995/11715724/text-id-11715782


North Central Texas Council of Governments  
Amendments 

3 Approved September 2018  
2018 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code 

 

 

1. Remainder Unchanged 

2. Remainder Unchanged 

3. Remainder Unchanged  

 

The wall of a building with windows in accordance with 2018 International Building Code, Section 1030 in 

Group R2 occupancies shall not be used as part of pool enclosure. Other windows that are part of a pool 

yard enclosure shall be permanently closed and unable to be opened for public pools. 

 
(Reason: To clarify specific Texas Health and Safety Code Chapter 757.007 & 2015 IBC, Section 1030.) 
 
**Section 305.6; Change to read as follows: 

 
305.6 Natural barriers used in a one and two family dwelling or townhouse. In the case where the pool 
or spa area abuts the edge of a lake or other natural body of water, public access is not permitted or allowed 
along the shoreline, and required barriers extend to and beyond the water’s edge a minimum of eighteen 
(18) inches, a barrier is not required between the natural body of water shoreline and the pool or spa. 

 
(Reason: Specific Texas statutes do not allow the use of natural barriers in lieu of fencing for public pools 
per Chapter 757.003).  
 
**Section 307.1.4 Accessibility; Add exception to Section to 307.1.4 as follows:  

  
Exception: Components of projects regulated by and registered with Architectural Barriers Division of 
Texas Department of Licensing and Regulation shall be deemed to be in compliance with the requirements 
of this chapter. 
 
(Reason: To accommodate buildings regulated under state law. Further clarified to mean Components that 
are specifically addressed by TDLR shall be exempt.) 

 
**Section 310; Change to read as follows: 

 
310.1 General. Suction entrapment avoidance for pools and spas shall be provided in accordance with 
APSP 7  or for public swimming pools in accordance with State of Texas Rules for Public Swimming Pools 
and Spas, Title 25 TAC Chapter 265 Subchapter L, Rule §265.190. 
 
[Remainder unchanged] 

 
(Reason: To clarify specific Texas statutes which regulate public pools and spas.) 

 
**Section 313.7; Change to read as follows: 

 
313.7 Emergency shutoff switch for spas and hot tubs. An emergency shutoff switch shall be provided 
to disconnect all power to recirculation and jet system pumps and air blowers. Emergency shutoff switches 
shall be: provided with access; located within sight of pools and spas and located not less than 5 feet (5') 
horizontally from the inside walls of the pool or spa. A clearly labeled emergency shutoff or control switch 
for the purpose of stopping the motor(s) that provide power to the recirculation system and jet system shall 
be installed at a point readily accessible to the users and not less than 1.5 m (5 ft.) away, adjacent to, and 
within sight of the spa or hot tub. This requirement shall not apply to one and two family dwellings and 
townhouses. 

 

Exception: Onground storable and permanent inground residential swimming pools. 

 



North Central Texas Council of Governments  
Amendments 

4 Approved September 2018  
2018 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code 

 

 

(Reason: Language is from 2017 NEC Article 680.41.) 

 
** Section 402.12; Change to read as follows: 

 

402.12 Water envelopes. The minimum diving water envelopes shall be in accordance with Table 
402.12 Texas department of State Health services, Administrative Code Title 25, Chapter 265, 
Section 186 (e) and Figure: 25 TAC 256.186 (e) (6). (Delete Table 402.12 and Figure 402.12)  
 

ADD: Figure: 25 TAC §265.186 (e) (6)       

Maximum Diving Board Height Over Water ¾ Meter 1 Meter 3 Meters 

Max. Diving Board Length 12 ft. 16 ft. 16 ft. 

Minimum Diving Board Overhang 2 ft. 6 in. 5 ft. 5 ft. 

D1 Minimum 8 ft. 6 in. 11 ft. 2 in. 12 ft. 2 in. 

D2 Minimum 9 ft. 10 ft. 10 in. 11 ft. 10 in. 

D3 Minimum 4 ft. 6 ft. 6 ft. 

L1 Minimum 4 ft. 5 ft. 5 ft. 

L2 Minimum 12 ft. 16 ft. 5 in. 19 ft. 9 in. 

L3 Minimum 14 ft. 10 in. 13 ft. 2 in. 13 ft. 11 in. 

L4 Minimum 30 ft. 10 in.  34 ft. 7 in. 38 ft. 8 in. 

L5 Minimum 8 ft. 10 ft. 13 ft. 

H Minimum 16 ft. 16 ft. 16 ft. 

From Plummet to Pool Wall at Side 9 ft. 10 ft. 11 ft. 6 in. 

From Plummet to Adjacent Plummet 10 ft. 10 ft. 10 ft. 

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

D

3 
D2 

D1 

Pt A 

11 Max 

 

L1 L2 L3 Typical 
 L4 

1 

10 Max Slope 30º Max.  
 

2’6” Min. 

 R 6’6”Typical  
4’6” 

Min 

H (Overhead 

Obstruction or Ceiling) 

4’Min
. 

10’ 

(1 Meter) 

L5 

4’Min 

4’Min 

Pt. B Pt. C 



North Central Texas Council of Governments  
Amendments 

5 Approved September 2018  
2018 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code 

 

 

(Reason: To avoid conflict with 25 TAC Chapter 265.)  

 
**Section 402.13; Change to read as follows: 

 

402.13 Ladders for diving equipment. Ladders shall be provided with two grab rails or two handrails. 
There shall be a uniform distance between ladder treads, with a 7 inch (178 mm minimum) distance and 12 
inch (305 mm) maximum distance. Supports, platforms, steps, and ladders for diving equipment shall be 
designed to carry the anticipated loads. Steps and ladders shall be of corrosion-resistant material, easily 
cleanable and with slip-resistant tread; 

 

Exception: The distance between treads for the top and bottom riser can vary. 
 
(Reason: To avoid conflict with 25 TAC Chapter 265.186 (c)(8)(d).)  

 
**Section 411.2.1 & 411.2.2; Change to read as follows: 

 

411.2.1 Tread dimensions and area. Treads shall have a minimum unobstructed horizontal depth (i.e., 
horizontal run) of 12 inches and a minimum width of 20 inches. not be less than 24 inches (607mm) at the 
leading edge. Treads shall have an unobstructed surface area of not less than 240 square inches 
(154838mm2) and an unobstructed horizontal depth of not less than10 inches (254 mm) at the center line. 
 

411.2.2 Risers. Risers for steps shall have a maximum uniform height of 10 inches, with the bottom riser 
height allowed to taper to zero except for the bottom riser, shall have a uniform height of not greater than 
12 inches (305 mm) measured at the center line. The bottom riser height is allowed to vary to the floor. 

 

(Reason: To avoid conflict with 25 TAC Chapter 265.186 (c)(7)(A)& (B).)  

 
**Section 411.5.1 & 411.5.2; Change to read as follows: 
 

411.5.1 Swimouts. Swimouts, located in either the deep or shallow area of a pool, shall comply with all 
of the following: 
 

1. Unchanged 

2. Unchanged 

3. Unchanged 

4. The leading edge shall be visibly set apart and provided with a horizontal solid or broken stripe at least 
1 inch wide on the top surface along the front leading edge of each step. This stripe shall be plainly 
visible to persons on the pool deck. The stripe shall be a contrasting color to the background on which 
it is applied, and the color shall be permanent in nature and shall be a slip-resistant surface 

 

411.5.2 Underwater seats and benches. Underwater seats and benches, whether used alone or in 
conjunction with pool stairs, shall comply with all of the following: 

1. Unchanged 
2. Unchanged 
3. Unchanged 
4. Unchanged 
5. The leading edge shall be visually set apart and provided with a horizontal solid or broken stripe at  

least 1 inch wide on the top surface along the front leading edge of each step. This stripe shall be  

 



North Central Texas Council of Governments  
Amendments 

6 Approved September 2018  
2018 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code 

 

 

plainly visible to persons on the pool deck. The stripe shall be a contrasting color to the background on 
which it is applied, and the color shall be permanent in nature and shall be a slip-resistant surface. 

6. Unchanged 

7. Unchanged 
 
(Reason: To avoid conflict with 25 TAC Chapter 265.184 (u) & 265.186 (c)(10).)  

 
**Section 603.2; Change to read as follows: 

 
603.2 Class D-2 pools. Where a Class D-2 pool has a bather- accessible depth greater than 4 1/2 feet 
(1372 mm), the floor shall have a distinctive marking at the 4 1/2 feet (1372 mm) water depth. 

 
Class A and B pools: Class A and B pools over 5 feet deep: the transition point of the pool from the shallow 
area to the deep area of the pool shall be visually set apart with a 4-inch minimum width row of floor tile, a 
painted line, or similar means using a color contrasting with the bottom; and a rope and float line shall be 
provided between 1 foot and 2 feet on the shallow side of the 5-foot depth along and parallel to this depth 
from one side of the pool to the other side. The floats shall be spaced at not greater than 7-foot intervals; 
and the floats shall be secured so they will not slide or bunch up. The stretched float line shall be of sufficient 
size and strength to offer a good handhold and support loads normally imposed by users. If the owner or 
operator of the pool knows or should have known in the exercise of ordinary care that a rope or float is 
missing, broken, or defective, the problem shall be promptly remedied 
 
(Reason: To avoid conflict with 25 TAC Chapter 265.199.)  
 

**Section 610.5.1; Change to read: 
 
610.5.1 Uniform height of 9 10 inches. Except for the bottom riser, risers at the centerline shall have a 
maximum uniform height of 9 10 inches (229 254 mm). The bottom riser height shall be permitted to vary 
from the other risers. 

 
(Reason: To avoid conflict with 25 TAC Chapter 265.186 (c)(7)(B).)  
 

***Section 804 Diving Water Envelopes; Change to read as follows:  

 
Section 804.1 General. The minimum diving water envelopes shall be in accordance with Table 804.1 and 

Figure 804.1, or the manufacturer’s specifications, whichever is greater.  Negative construction tolerances 

shall not be applied to the dimensions of the minimum diving water envelopes given in Table 804.1. 

 

(Reason: To provide minimum standards and to clarify specific manufactures specifications of the diving 
equipment.) 

 
 

END 


	v2023 A-00 Exibit Title Page
	v2023 A-01 Final 2018 Code Amendments  - Int. Building Code
	v2023 A-02 FInal 2018 Code Amendments - Int. Residential Code
	v2023 A-03 Final Local Amendments - National Electrical Code
	v2023 A-04 Final 2018 Code Amendments - Int. Fuel Gas Code
	v2023 A-05 Final 2018 Code Amendments - Int. Mechanical Code
	v2023 A-06 Final 2018 Code Amendments - Int. Plumbing Code
	v2023 A-07 Final 2018 IPMC Code Amendments
	v2023 A-08 Final 2018 Code Amendments - Int. Fire Code
	v2023 A-09 Final 2018 Code Amendments - Int. Energy Code
	v2023 A-10 Final 2018 Code Amendments - Int. Existing Building Code
	v2023 A-11 Final 2018 Code Amendments - Int. Swimming Pool and Spa Code



